Bids Results
From 03/10/2026 To 03/10/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. / L.P.
EH8 25066396 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) Steven / Rose
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $8,788.00 Apparent low bidder
RECON RESTORATION $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $8,800.00 Selected to bid
ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)




Bids Results
From 03/10/2026 To 03/10/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. /L.P.
EHS8 25066442 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) David / Tracy
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $38,236.00 Unsuccessful bid
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS Selected to bid
ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Selected to bid
RECON RESTORATION $36,700.00 Unsuccessful bid
ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $34,555.00 Awarded




Bids Results
From 03/10/2026 To 03/10/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. /L.P.
EHS8 25066513 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) David / Tracy
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Selected to bid
RECON RESTORATION $24,800.00 Unsuccessful bid
ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $26,350.00 Unsuccessful bid
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS Selected to bid
BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $23,884.00 Awarded




Bids Results
From 03/10/2026 To 03/10/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. /L.P.
EHS8 25066547 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) Moeen / Rose
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS Selected to bid
ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $15,975.00 Apparent low bidder
BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $20,076.00 Unsuccessful bid
ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Selected to bid
RECON RESTORATION $19,000.00 Unsuccessful bid




Bids Results
From 03/10/2026 To 03/10/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. /L.P.
EHS8 25066613 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) David / Rose
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $56,844.00 Unsuccessful bid
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS Selected to bid
ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $57,930.00 Unsuccessful bid
RECON RESTORATION $55,500.00 Awarded
ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Selected to bid




Bids Results
From 03/10/2026 To 03/10/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. /L.P.
EHS8 25066662 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) David / Rose
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result

RECON RESTORATION Selected to bid
ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Selected to bid
ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $14,720.00 Unsuccessful bid
BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $13,220.00 Awarded
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS Selected to bid




