Bids Results
From 03/03/2026 To 03/03/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. / L.P.
EH8 25066252 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) Moeen / Rose
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $27,865.00 Unsuccessful bid
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS $0.00 No response
BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $27,572.00 Unsuccessful bid
ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC $0.00 No response
RECON RESTORATION $27,500.00 Awarded




Bids Results
From 03/03/2026 To 03/03/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. /L.P.
EHS8 25066636 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) Steven / Tracy
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result
BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $7,988.00 Apparent low bidder
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS $0.00 No response
RECON RESTORATION Response "no bid" (busy)
ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $8,200.00 Unsuccessful bid

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC

$0.00

No response




Bids Results
From 03/03/2026 To 03/03/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. /L.P.
EHS8 25066732 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) Mitra / Tracy
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $8,900.00 Apparent low bidder
RECON RESTORATION $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $9,044.00 Unsuccessful bid




Bids Results
From 03/03/2026 To 03/03/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. /L.P.
EHS8 25066790 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) Mitra / Tracy
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result
RECON RESTORATION $36,100.00 Unsuccessful bid
ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $28,300.00 Unsuccessful bid
BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $25,520.00 Apparent low bidder
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)




Bids Results
From 03/03/2026 To 03/03/2026

Program Case # Trade R.S. /L.P.
EHS8 25066836 (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3) Mitra / Tracy
Contractor Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Bid Result

RECON RESTORATION $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Ci $0.00 No response
ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC $0.00 Response "no bid" (busy)
BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT $9,188.00 Apparent low bidder




