
Case # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 12/09/2025 To 12/09/2025

EH8 24065764 Mitra / Rose (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT COMPANY Unsuccessful bid$60,050.00

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$38,400.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC Response "no bid" (busy)

APEX AZ CONTRACTING LLC Response "no bid" (busy)

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$44,856.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Response "no bid" (busy)

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Apparent low bidder$36,100.00



Case # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 12/09/2025 To 12/09/2025

EH8 25066341 Moeen / Rose (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT COMPANY Unsuccessful bid$47,850.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Apparent low bidder$46,184.00

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$56,800.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Unsuccessful bid$48,676.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Unsuccessful bid$52,000.00

APEX AZ CONTRACTING LLC No response



Case # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 12/09/2025 To 12/09/2025

EH8 25066345 Moeen / Tracy (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

APEX AZ CONTRACTING LLC No response

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT COMPANY Unsuccessful bid$79,750.00

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Apparent low bidder$64,475.00

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$82,850.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Unsuccessful bid$81,482.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$64,893.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response



Case # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 12/09/2025 To 12/09/2025

EH8 25066676 Adam / Tracy (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$20,300.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

APEX AZ CONTRACTING LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Apparent low bidder$15,320.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT COMPANY Unsuccessful bid$17,800.00


