
Case # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 08/26/2025 To 08/26/2025

RR2 22063247 Adam / Omar (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Selected to bid$217,044.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

RECON RESTORATION Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

APEX AZ CONTRACTING LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT COMPANY Apparent low bidder$173,040.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00



Case # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 08/26/2025 To 08/26/2025

RR2 22063248 Moeen / Omar (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

APEX AZ CONTRACTING LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC Selected to bid$318,432.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Selected to bid$214,872.00

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT COMPANY Apparent low bidder$169,055.00

RECON RESTORATION Selected to bid



Case # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 08/26/2025 To 08/26/2025

HD8 25066013 Mitra / Tracy (<=$25K) Rehab Resdl (C61)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

APEX AZ CONTRACTING LLC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Rejected (error or incomplete)$11,500.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT COMPANY Apparent low bidder$13,600.00

RECON RESTORATION Response "no bid" (busy)$0.00


