¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee
PART 2—ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT
SECTION 103

DEPARTMENT OF PLUMBING INSPECTION
RESERVED

SECTION 104
DUTIES AND POWERS OF THE CODE OFFICIAL
RESERVED




SECTION 105
APPROVAL
RESERVED




SECTION 106
PERMITS
RESERVED







SECTION 107
INSPECTIONS AND TESTING
RESERVED










SECTION 108
VIOLATIONS
RESERVED




SECTION 109
MEANS OF APPEAL
RESERVED




SECTION 110
TEMPORARY EQUIPMENT, SYSTEMS AND USES
RESERVED




Reasons: The deleted provisions are contained in the Phoenix Building Construction Code, 2012 IBC,
which is being used as a centralized location for the administrative provisions. These provisions may
conflict with the adopted administrative code sections and retaining them is redundant.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
General Definitions, Section 202

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

GREASE REMOVAL DEVICE. A plumbing appurtenance that is installed in the sanitary drainage system
to intercept free-floating fats, oils and grease from waste water discharge. Such a device operates on a
time-or event-controlled basis and has the ability to remove free-floating fats, oils and grease automatically
without intervention from the use except for maintenance. These devices must be able to perform as a
gravity interceptor if mechanical or electrical power is lost and provide continuous separation.

Reasons: Grease removal devices rely on moving parts and electricity to separate grease from the waste
stream; therefore, if moving parts break down or electrical power is lost the device will still be able to
operate as a passive device and prevent grease from entering the sewer system.

*DAB Technical asked for the last sentence to be reworked and accepted as modified.

Cost Impact: No cost impact. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform
Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 01/17/2013
[ 1 Approved as submitted  [X] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 01/17/2013

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Table 403.1 and footnotes

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee
Table 403.1 - continued
MINIMUM NUMBER OF REQUIRED PLUMBING FIXTURES®
(See Sections 403.2 and 403.3)

Delete all service sink requirements from Table 403.1

f. Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of 15-50 or fewer.

Reasons: These revisions are made to provide consistency between the UPC and IPC and the minimum
plumbing fixture table that is found in the 2012 International Building Code.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
[ 1 Approved as submitted  [X] Modified and approved  [] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 403.2

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

403.2 Separate Facilities. Where plumbing fixtures are required, separate facilities shall be provided for
each sex.

Exceptions:
1. Separate facilities shall not be required for dwelling units and sleeping units.

2. Separate facilities shall not be required in structures or tenant spaces with a total occupant load,
including both employees and customers, of 15 or fewer.

3. Separate facilities shall not be required in mercantile and business occupancies in which the
maximum occupant load is 50 100 or fewer.

Reasons: These revisions are made to provide consistency between the 2012 UPC section 422.2, 2012
IBC section 2902.2 and the 2012 IPC to allow for small business and mercantile occupancies to provide a
single toilet facility for up to 50 occupants.

Cost Impact: Cost savings for small mercantile and business occupancies.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 410.3, 410.4

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

Add new definitions as follows:

DRINKING FOUNTAIN. A plumbing fixture that is connected to the potable water distribution system and
the drainage system. The fixture allows the user to obtain a drink directly from a stream of flowing water
without the use of any accessories.

WATER DISPENSER. A plumbing fixture that is manually controlled by the user for the purpose of
dispensing potable drinking water into a receptacle such as a cup, glass or bottle. Such fixture is
connected to the potable water distribution system of the premises. This definition also includes a
freestanding apparatus for the same purpose that is not connected to the potable water distribution system
and that is supplied with potable water from a container, bottle or reservaoir.

WATER COOLER. A drinking fountain that incorporates a means of reducing the temperature of the water
supplied to it from the potable water distribution system.

410.3 Substitution. Where restaurants provide drinking water in a container free of charge, drinking
fountains shall not be required in those restaurants. In other occupancies where drinking fountains are
required, watercoolers-or-bettled water dispensers shall be permitted to be substituted for not more than
50 percent of the required number of drinking fountains.

410.4 Prohibited location. Drinking fountains, water coolers and bettle water dispensers shall not be
installed in public restrooms.

Reasons: There is often confusion regarding what is or is not a water cooler. Some people think that a
water cooler is a drinking fountain since typically they also cool the water that is being dispensed. Others
think that a water cooler is a bottled water dispenser that is capable of cooling the water dispensed.
Currently the code does not define any of the terms. In reality, drinking fountains are drinking fountains
and everything else is some form of a water dispenser. Whether or not the water is cooled is irrelevant.
The code does not require cooled water. The code can be simplified in Section 410.3 by referring only to
drinking fountains or their alternative, water dispensers. The new definitions establish that a drinking
fountain and a water dispenser that is connected to the potable water supply system are both plumbing
fixtures by definition and a bottled water dispenser is not a plumbing fixture by definition. It is necessary to
be clear as to what the code requires to be provided and also what the code intends to allow as an
alternative. This proposal also paves the way for new technology that is being marketed and installed
today, namely water dispensers that are built into a wall, connected to the potable water supply system
and dispense water into cups, glasses and bottles. These units typically treat the potable water with
additional filtering and/or reverse osmasis treatment.

Cost Impact: Cost savings from replacing drinking fountain installations with water dispensers.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 419.2

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

419.2 Subst|tut|on for water closets Ln—eaeh—bath#eem—eﬁe#eueem—ewmts—shathqeebe—subsm%ed—te#
jes- Urinals shall
not be subst|tuted for more than 50 percent of the requwed water cIosets in aII other occupancies.

Reasons: These revisions are made to provide consistency between the UPC and IPC and the minimum
plumbing fixture table that is found in the 2012 International Building Code.

Cost Impact: None

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
[ ] Approved as submitted  [X] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 605.3 Table 605.3

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

Table 605.3 Water Service Pipe
MATERIAL
) o

STANDARD
A \Vi -

Reasons:
ABS material conflicts with first sentence of IPC Section 605.3 which requires water service pipe to
conform to NSF 61.

Cost Impact: None

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 605.5 Table 605.5

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

Table 605.5 PIPE FITTINGS
MATERIAL STANDARD

Reasons: ABS material conflicts with second sentence of IPC Section 605.5 which requires pipe fittings
utilized in water supply systems to comply with NSF 61.

Cost Impact: None

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 608.3.2

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

New Section

608.3.2 Access and Clearance. Access and clearance shall be provided for the required testing,
maintenance, and repair. Access and clearance shall be in accordance with manufacturer’s instructions,
and not less than 12 inches between the lowest portion of the assembly and grade, floor, or platform.
Elevated installations that exceed 5 feet above the floor or grade shall be provided with a platform capable
of supporting a tester or maintenance person. Secondary backflow assemblies shall be installed above
ground, as close as practicable to the point of service delivery. A minimum 3-foot (914 mm) clear space
shall be maintained for testing, maintenance and repair.

Reasons:

Inserts code language regarding elevated installations.

Clarifies that secondary backflow prevention assemblies shall be installed above ground.

Clarifies the minimum required clearance dimensions for secondary backflow prevention assemblies.
Coordinates with Phoenix Fire Code Section 901.10 requirements for access to fire protection
equipment.

Cost Impact: None

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 608.7.1

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

New Section
608.7.1 Prohibited Locations. Backflow prevention devices shall not be installed in pits, underground

vaults, or submerged locations.

Reasons:

Phoenix City Code Chapter 37-144 (d) regarding backflow assembly accessibility and testing presents
design constraints for adequate clearance and drainage in a proposed vault installation. Proposed
vault dimensions typically restrict full accessibility to all parts of an assembly.

Eliminates the possibility of installing a backflow prevention assembly in a pit or vault.

Reflects installation drawings shown in City of Phoenix Standard Details P1351 through P1355.
Corresponds to manufacturer’s installation instructions which restrict underground installations to AHJ
approval.

Above ground installation assures that Fire Department personnel have visual access to fire line
backflow prevention assembly shut off valves and verifies that the assembly OS&Y (outside stem &
yoke) shut-off valves are open by presence of a rising stem.

Cost Impact: None

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 608.7.2

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

New Section

608.7.2 Secondary Backflow Protection. The following activities or facilities shall have reduced
pressure principle backflow prevention assemblies installed as close as practicable to the point of service
delivery: Hospitals, surgical clinics, laboratories, morgues, mortuaries, veterinary hospitals, industrial
occupancies, packing plants, slaughter houses, chemical plants, municipal waste treatment facilities, and
construction water services.

Note: Multiple water services which are interconnected onsite shall be provided with not less than a
Double Check Valve Assembly at each service connection.

Reasons: ADEQ, Maricopa County and City of Phoenix Water Department all require secondary
protection for the services cited.

Cost Impact:
None — This amendment carries over from previous code cycles.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 704.1

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

SECTION 704
DRAINAGE PIPING INSTALLATION

704.1 Slope of horizontal drainage piping. Horizontal drainage piping shall be installed in uniform
alignment at uniform slopes. The slope of a horizontal drainage pipe shall be not less than that indicated
by Table 704.1.

Exception: The Authority Having Jurisdiction may approve a lessor slope for building sewers in
lieu of a sewage ejector or pumping station when a registered engineer or architect certifies the
building sewer design and its installation, and when the building owner agrees in writing under
notary to accept the lessor slope. Certification of the building sewer shall meet the special
inspection requirements of the Phoenix Building Construction Code.

Reasons:

This amendment adds the option of using a lessor slope for building sewers based on engineering
calculations. The owner will be required to sign under notary that they have accepted the lessor slope. The
registrant shall certify the design and final installation through special inspection.

Cost Impact: This amendment will reduce the costs associated with the previous approval process for low
slope sewer installations.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Special Wastes, Section 803.2

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

803.2 Neutralizing device required for corrosive wastes. Corrosive liquids, spent acids or other
harmful chemicals that destroy or injure a drain, sewer, soil or waste pipe, or create noxious or toxic
flumes or interfere with the sewage treatment processes shall not be discharge into the plumbing system
without being thoroughly diluted; neutralized, or treated by passing through an approved dilution-or
neutralizing device. Such devices shall be automatically provided with a sufficient supply of diluting-water
or neutralizing medium so as to make the contents noninjurious before discharge into the drainage
system. The nature of the corrosive or harmful waste and the method of its treatment er-dilution shall be
approved prior to installation.

Reasons: Diluting chemical wastes is prohibited by the Clean Water Act, 40 CFR, 403.6 (d).

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 1002.4

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

1002.4 Trap seals. Each fixture trap shall have a liquid seal of not less than 2 inches (51 mm) and not
more than 4 inches (102 mm), or deeper for special designs relating to accessible fixtures. Where a trap
seal is subject to loss by evaporation, a trap seal primer valve shall be installed. Trap seal primer valves
shall connect to the trap at a point above the level of the trap seal. A trap seal primer valve shall conform
to ASSE 1018 or ASSE 1044.

Exception: Trap seal primer valves are not required when an alternative device is provided to
prevent evaporation of the liguid seal. Barrier type floor drain devices used to prevent evaporation
shall conform to ASSE 1072, be accessible for maintenance and installed in accordance with
manufacturer’s instructions. A source of water for filling of traps shall be located in the vicinity of
the plumbing fixture.

Reasons:

A barrier-type device has been developed for installation in a floor drain that prevents evaporation of the
required liquid seal. This type of device opens when liquid enters the drain and then closes to prevent the
migration of sewer gases back into the building. The devices are installed in the body of the floor drain and
are typically made of an elastomeric material. Many of these devices are tested to several national
standards such as ASSE 1072 and are listed by both the ICC-ES (IPC) and IAPMO (UPC) major Code
agencies. The current Code requires that a trap seal primer valve be installed where trap seals are subject
to evaporation. Trap seal primer valves have been proven to be adversely affected by the hard water in
Phoenix and very often fail, thus leaving no trap seal protection. Once the liquid in the trap evaporates,
sewer gas will migrate into the building. This exception will allow use of the listed devices in place of the
trap seal primer valves required by the Code section.

Cost Impact: Cost savings from replacement of trap seal primer valves with lower cost barrier-type
devices and reduced maintenance.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [[] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Approval, Section 1003.2

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1003.2 Approval. The size, type and location of each interceptor and of each separator shall be designed
and installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and the requirements of this-section

based-on-the-anticipated-conditions-of-use the Authority Having Jurisdiction. Wastes that do not require

treatment or separation shall not be discharged into any interceptor or separator.

Reasons: Phoenix City Code Section 28-13 gives approval authority for all interceptors to the Director of
Water Services. This code change is an administrative change to clarify approval authority for these
devices in the International Plumbing Code.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
[ ] Approved as submitted  [X] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Grease Interceptors, Section 1003.3.1

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1003.3.1 Grease interceptors and automatic grease removal devices. A grease interceptor or
automatic grease removal device shall be required to receive the drainage from fixtures and equipment
with grease laden waste located in food preparation areas, such as in restaurants, hotel kitchens, hospitals
school kitchens, bars, factory cafeterias and clubs. Fixtures and equipment shall include pot sinks,
prerinse sinks; soup kettles or similar devices; wok stations; floor drains or sinks into which kettles are
drained; automatic hood wash units and dishwashers without prerinse sinks. Grease interceptors and
automatic grease removal devices shall receive waste only from fixtures and equipment that allow fats, oils
or grease to be discharged. Wherelack-of space-or-otherconstraints-preventthe-installation-or

Reasons:

There is limited testing on the performance of grease interceptors installed in series. Installing a grease
interceptor suspended above a floor space has the potential to become a public nuisance. The
maintenance of these devices is generally neglected and over time the interceptor can deteriate and leak
on the floor below.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Food Waste Grinders, Section 1003.3.2

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

chemicals, enzymes and bacteria shall not discharge into the food waste grinder.

Reasons:
Food waste grinders contribute grease and food waste to the building drainage system and have the
potential to cause blockages in the public sewer system.

Cost Impact: There is a cost impact to install a gravity interceptor versus a solids interceptor if the facility
chooses to install a food waste grinder. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006
Uniform Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Grease Interceptor Capacity, Section 1003.3.4.1

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1003.3.4.1 Grease interceptor capacity. Grease interceptors shall have the grease retention capacity

indicated in Table 1003.3.4.1 for the flow- through rates indicated.

TABLE 1003.3.4.1
CAPACITY OF GREASE INTERCEPTORS *

Total Number of Grease | TOTAL FLOW-THROUGH RATING GREASE RETENTION
Retention Fixtures (gpm) CAPACITY (pounds)
Connected
- 4 8
6 12
- 7 14
- 9 18
- 10 20
- 12 24
- 14 28
- 15 30
- 18 36
1 20 40
2 25 50
3 35 70
4 50 100
- 75 150
- 100 200

For Sl: 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/m, 1 pound = 0.454 kg.

a. Fer Total flow — through ratings greater than

100-(gpm);-double-the-flow-through-rating-to
determine-the-grease retention-capacity-{pounds). 50 (gpm) shall be specially approved by the

Authority Having Jurisdiction.

b. For installations with more than (4) fixtures, the Authority Having Jurisdiction may permit the use

of larger devices.

Reasons: The Total Number of Retention Fixtures, Total Flow—Through Ratings and Retention

Capacities were developed from three public forums held in 1997 to standardize the design of interceptors.
These forums provided design and sizing guidelines with input from the public and are still currently used

to size interceptors in the City of Phoenix as well as neighboring cities.

Cost Impact: No cost impact. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform

Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee

Date: 12/13/2012

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Interceptor Maintenance, Section 1003.3.4.3

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1003.3.4.3 Interceptor Maintenance. A two way cleanout shall be installed on the discharge side of all
hydromechanical grease interceptors.

Reasons: The purpose of this code section is to provide an entry point to clean the line downstream of
the device and back to the device.

Cost Impact: The cost impact is minimal to install additional piping for cleanouts. This requirement is an
amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 1106.1

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

1106.1 General. The size of the vertical conductors and leaders, building storm drains, building storm
sewers, and any horizontal branches of such dralns or sewers shaII be based on an hourly ralnfall rate of
three (3) mches per hour the , -

Reasons:

Current language in the 2006 UPC requires roof drain sizing based on six (6) inches per hour rainfall rate.
The 2012 UPC and the 2012 IPC list rainfall rates for Phoenix as 2.2 and 2.5 inches per hour, respectively.
It is recommended that a rainfall rate of three (3) inches per hour be used for ease of using the sizing
tables and to provide consistency between the two plumbing codes.

** DAB Technical asked for further structural input on changing the rainfall rate to 3 inches per hour.

Cost Impact: Cost savings from decreasing the size of rainwater piping systems.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 02/12/2013
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 2/21/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 1106.5

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

are used for primary and/or secondary (emergency overflow) roof drainage, the quantity, size, location and

inlet elevation of the scuppers shall be sized to prevent the depth of ponding water from exceeding that for
which the roof was designed as determined by Section 1611.1 of the 2012 International Building Code.
Scupper openings shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) in height and have an opening width equal to
the circumference of the roof drain required for the area served, sized in accordance with Table 1106.2(1).
The flow through the primary system shall not be considered when locating and sizing scuppers. A rainfall
rate of three (3) inches per hour shall be used for sizing purposes.

Reasons:

Current language in the 2012 IPC and IBC implies that scuppers are only approved for secondary roof
drainage. It has been a long standing practice in Phoenix to allow the use of scuppers as primary roof
drains. This proposal adds the acceptance of scuppers as primary roof drains and matches the sizing

criteria found for the secondary scuppers in IPC 1108.3 and IBC 1503.4.2.

** DAB Technical asked for further structural input on changing the rainfall rate to 3 inches per hour.

Cost Impact: Cost savings from allowing scuppers for primary roof drainage.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
[ ] Approved as submitted  [X] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 02/12/2013
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 2/21/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken



javascript:Next('./icod_ibc_2012_16_par120.htm');

¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Section 1108.3

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

1108.3 Sizing of secondary drains. Secondary (emergency) roof drain systems shall be sized in
accordance with Section 1106 based on the rainfall rate for which the primary system is sized in Tables
1106.2(1), 1106.2(2), 1106.3 and 1106.6. Scuppers shall be sized to prevent the depth of ponding water
from exceeding that for which the roof was designed as determined by Section 1101.7. Scuppers shall
have an opening dimension of not less than 4 inches (102 mm)_in height and have an opening width equal
to the circumference of the roof drain required for the area served, sized in accordance with Table
1106.2(1). The flow through the primary system shall not be considered when sizing the secondary roof
drain system.

Reasons:
This proposal eliminates any confusion between this section and section 1106.5 regarding the required
opening width dimensions for scuppers.

** DAB Technical asked for further structural input on changing the rainfall rate to 3 inches per hour.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [[] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 02/12/2013
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 2/21/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken



javascript:Next('./icod_ipc_2012_11_par026.htm');
javascript:Next('./icod_ipc_2012_11_par007.htm');

¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code

Section 1109.1

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

SECTION 1109
COMBINED SANITARY AND STORM SYSTEM
(Reserved)

Reasons:

The city of Phoenix does not allow for combined sanitary and storm drainage systems. This type of
combined system is under the jurisdiction of the city of Phoenix Water Services Department.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee

Date: 01/03/2013

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken



javascript:Next('./icod_ipc_2012_11_par028.htm');

¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

IPC CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 International Plumbing Code
Appendices

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

Adopt Appendices: E & F

Reasons:
Appendix E provides two methods of water pipe sizing not provided in the body of the code. Appendix F
contains structural safety provisions that match those found in the IBC and the UPC

Cost Impact:
No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 1/17/13
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Chapter 2 Definitions, Section 209.0

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

209.0 Gravity Grease Interceptor. A plumbing appurtenance or appliance that is installed in a sanitary
drainage system to intercept nonpetroleum fats, oils and greases (FOG) from a wastewater discharge and
is identified by volume, 306 12 or 17 minute retention time, baffle(s), not less than two compartments, a
total volume of not less than 3606 500 gallons (31435 1895 L), and gravity separation. [These interceptors
comply with the requirements of Chapter 10 or are-designed by a registered professional engineer and
approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.] Gravity grease interceptors are-generally shall be installed
outside unless otherwise approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

Reasons: The larger interceptor has two man-ways and two compartments which makes it easier for the
user to clean and maintain the device. The 12 and 17 minute retention time is currently used to size
interceptors in the City of Phoenix and was developed based on feedback from three public forums held in
1997 to address sizing of commercial grease interceptors. Gravity interceptors are generally installed
outside to prevent sewer gases and odors from entering the building.

Cost Impact: The cost impact to install a 500 gallon interceptor versus a 300 gallon interceptor is minimal
for a facility. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 01/17/2013
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 01/17/2013
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Chapter 2 Definitions, Section 209.0

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

209.0 Grease Removal Device (GRD). A hydromechanical grease interceptor that automatically,
mechanically removes non-petroleum fats, oils and grease (FOG) from the interceptor, the control of which
are either automatic or manually initiated. These devices must be able to perform as a gravity interceptor
if mechanical or electrical power is lost and be able to provide continued separation.

Reasons: Grease removal devices rely on moving parts and electricity to separate grease from the waste
stream; therefore, if moving parts break down or electrical power is lost the device will still be able to
operate as a passive device and prevent grease from entering the sewer system.

*DAB Technical asked for the last sentence to be reworked and accepted as modified.

Cost Impact: No cost impact. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform
Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 01/17/2013
[1 Approved as submitted  [X] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 01/17/2013
X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

BUILDING CONSTRUCTION CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendment to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Chapter 2 Definitions, Section 210.0

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

210.0 Hydromechanical Grease Interceptor. A plumbing appurtenance or appliance that is installed in
a sanitary drainage system to intercept nonpetroleum fats, oil and grease (FOG) from a wastewater
discharge and is identified by flow rate, and separation and retention efficiency. The design incorporates
air entrainment, hydromechanical separation, interior baffling, or barriers in combination or separately, and
one of the following:

A - External flow control, with air intake (vent), directly connected

B --External-flow-control-withoutair-intake-{vent),-directly connected Internal flow control, directly

connected
i L _direct] |
i L indi I
These interceptors comply with the requirements of Table 1014.2.1 and Table 1014.2.1A.

Hydromechanical grease interceptors are generally installed inside and they must be able to function as
gravity interceptors if mechanical or electrical power is lost.

Reasons:

Flow control is necessary to regulate the flow into a hydromechanical interceptor and prevent connected
plumbing fixtures from exceeding the grease retention capacity of the device. Installing a
hydromechanical device without this control valve will negatively affect the grease retention and separation
efficiency of the device. Hydromechanical grease interceptors must be able to function as gravity
interceptors if mechanical or electrical power is lost otherwise the device will allow grease to enter the
sanitary drainage system.

Cost Impact: No cost impact. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform
Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 415.2, 4154

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

Add new definitions as follows:

DRINKING FOUNTAIN. A plumbing fixture that is connected to the potable water distribution system and
the drainage system. The fixture allows the user to obtain a drink directly from a stream of flowing water
without the use of any accessories.

WATER DISPENSER. A plumbing fixture that is manually controlled by the user for the purpose of
dispensing potable drinking water into a receptacle such as a cup, glass or bottle. Such fixture is
connected to the potable water distribution system of the premises. This definition also includes a
freestanding apparatus for the same purpose that is not connected to the potable water distribution system
and that is supplied with potable water from a container, bottle or reservaoir.

WATER COOLER. A drinking fountain that incorporates a means of reducing the temperature of the water
supplied to it from the potable water distribution system.

415.2 Where required. Where foodH
substituted-for drinking-fountains restaurants provrde drrnkrnq water ina contarner free of charqe drinking
fountains shall not be required in those restaurants. In other occupancies where drinking fountains are
required, water dispensers shall be permitted to be substituted for not more than 50 percent of the
required number of drinking fountains. Drinking fountains shall not be required for an occupant load of 39
50 or less.

415.4 Prohibited location. Drinking fountains, water coolers and water dispensers shall not be installed in
toilet rooms.

Reasons:

There is often confusion regarding what is or is not a water cooler. Some people think that a water cooler
is a drinking fountain since typically they also cool the water that is being dispensed. Others think that a
water cooler is a bottled water dispenser that is capable of cooling the water dispensed. Currently the code
does not define any of the terms. In reality, drinking fountains are drinking fountains and everything else is
some form of a water dispenser. Whether or not the water is cooled is irrelevant. The code does not
require cooled water. The code can be simplified in Section 415.2 by referring only to drinking fountains or
their alternative, water dispensers. The new definitions establish that a drinking fountain and a water
dispenser that is connected to the potable water supply system are both plumbing fixtures by definition
and a bottled water dispenser is not a plumbing fixture by definition. It is necessary to be clear as to what
the code requires to be provided and also what the code intends to allow as an alternative. This proposal
also paves the way for new technology that is being marketed and installed today, namely water
dispensers that are built into a wall, connected to the potable water supply system and dispense water into
cups, glasses and bottles. These units typically treat the potable water with additional filtering and/or
reverse osmosis treatment.

The number of occupants for exempt status is revised to coordinate with the 2012 IPC footnote “f” to Table
403.1.

Cost Impact: Cost savings from replacing drinking fountain installations with water dispensers.




ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee

Date: 12/20/2012

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Table 422.1 and footnotes

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

Table 422.1
Minimum Plumbing Facilities

Replace the entire table and footnotes with Table 403.1 including amended footnotes from the 2012
IPC. Rename as Table 422.1. Also delete all service sink requirements from the table.

f. Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of £5-50 or fewer.

h. Where urinals are provided they may be substituted for water closets, provided the number of water
closets is not reduced to less than 50% of the minimum required by Table 422.1.

Reasons:
These revisions are made to provide consistency between the UPC and IPC and the minimum plumbing
fixture table that is found in the 2012 International Building Code.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
[ ] Approved as submitted  [X] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 422.2

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee
422.2 Separate Facilities. Separate toilet facilities shall be provided for each sex.
Exceptions:

(1) Residential installations.

(2) In occupancies with a total occupant load of 38 15 or less, including customers and employees,
one toilet facility, designed for use by no more than one person at a time, shall be permitted for
use by both sexes.

(3) In business and mercantile occupancies with a total occupant load of 50 or less including

customers and employees, one toilet facility, designed for use by no more than one person at a
time, shall be permitted for use by both sexes.

Reasons:

Past versions of the UPC as well as the current 2012 IPC have used 15 occupants as the threshold value
for a unisex restroom for many years. This practice should be continued to provide consistency. This also
provides consistency with 2012 IPC section 403.2.

Cost Impact: Cost savings for small buildings of all occupancies.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 603.4.3

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

603.4.3 Access and Clearance. Access and clearance shall be provided for the required testing,
maintenance, and repair. Access and clearance shall be in accordance with manufacturer’s instructions,
and not less than 12 inches between the lowest portion of the assembly and grade, floor, or platform.
installations-elevated Elevated installations that exceed 5 feet above the floor or grade shall be provided
with a platform capable of supporting a tester or maintenance person. Secondary backflow assemblies
shall be installed above ground, as close as practicable to the point of service delivery. A minimum 3-foot
(914 mm) clear space shall be maintained for testing, maintenance and repair.

Reasons:

e Clears up original grammatically incorrect code language regarding elevated installations.

e Clarifies that secondary backflow prevention assemblies shall be installed above ground.

o Clarifies the minimum required clearance dimensions for secondary backflow prevention assemblies.

e Coordinates with Phoenix Fire Code Section 901.10 requirements for access to fire protection
equipment.

Cost Impact:
None

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 603.4.9

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

603.4.9 Prohibited Locations. Backflow prevention devices with-atmospheric-vents-or-peorts shall not be
installed in pits, underground vaults, or submerged locations.

Reasons:

Phoenix City Code Chapter 37-144 (d) regarding backflow assembly accessibility and testing presents
design constraints for adequate clearance and drainage in a proposed vault installation. Proposed
vault dimensions typically restrict full accessibility to all parts of an assembly.

Eliminates the possibility of installing a backflow prevention assembly in a pit or vault.

Adds the word vault to better define underground locations.

Reflects installation drawings shown in City of Phoenix Standard Details P1351 through P1355.
Corresponds to manufacturer’s installation instructions which restrict underground installations to AHJ
approval.

Above ground installation assures that Fire Department personnel have visual access to fire line
backflow prevention assembly shut off valves and verifies that the assembly OS&Y (outside stem &
yoke) shut-off valves are open by presence of a rising stem.

Cost Impact: None.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 603.4.10

Submitted by:  Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

603.4.10 Secondary Backflow Protection. The following activities or facilities shall have reduced
pressure principle backflow prevention assemblies installed as close as practicable to the point of service
delivery: Hospitals, surgical clinics, laboratories, morgues, mortuaries, veterinary hospitals, industrial
occupancies, packing plants, slaughter houses, chemical plants, municipal waste treatment facilities, and
construction water services.

Note: Multiple water services which are interconnected onsite shall be provided with not less than a
Double Check Valve Assembly at each service connection.

Reasons:
ADEQ, Maricopa County and city of Phoenix Water Department all require secondary protection for the
services cited.

Cost Impact:
None — This amendment carries over from previous code cycles.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 718.1

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee
718.1 Grade, Support, and Protection of Building Sewers.

718.1 Slope. Building sewers shall be run in practical alignment and at a uniform slope of not less than %
inch per foot (20.8 mm/m) toward the point of disposal.

Exceptions:

(1) Where approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction and where it is impractical, due to depth of the
street sewer or to the structural features or to the arrangement of a building or structure, to obtain a
slope of % inch per foot (20.8 mm/m), such pipe or piping 4 inches (100 mm) through 6 inches (150
mm) shall be permitted to have a slope of not less than 1/8 inch per foot (10.4 mm/m) and such piping
8 inches (200 mm) and larger shall be permitted to have a slope of not less than 1/16 inch per foot (5.2
mm/m).

(2) The Authority Having Jurisdiction may approve a lessor slope in lieu of a sewage ejector or pumping
station when a registered engineer or architect certifies the sewer design and its installation, and when
the building owner agrees in writing under notary to accept the lessor slope. Certification of the
building sewer shall meet the special inspection requirements of the Phoenix Building Construction
Code.

Reasons:

This amendment adds the option of using a lessor slope for building sewers based on engineering
calculations. The owner will be required to sign under notary that they have accepted the lessor slope. The
registrant shall certify the design and final installation through special inspection.

Cost Impact: This amendment will reduce the costs associated with the current approval process for low
slope sewer installations.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Air Admittance Valves, Section 912.0

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Code Committee

912.0 Air Admittance Valves

912.1 General. Vent systems shall be allowed to be served by approved air admittance valves. Stack-type
air admittance valves shall be in conformance with ASSE 1050 and individual and branch-type air
admittance valves shall be in conformance with ASSE 1051.

912.2 Installation. The valves shall be installed in accordance with the requirements of this section and
the manufacturer’s installation instructions. Air admittance valves shall be installed after the drain, waste
and vent testing required by Sections 712.2 or 712.3 has been approved by the administrative authority.

912.3 Where permitted. Individual and branch vents shall be permitted to terminate with a connection to
an individual or branch-type air admittance valve in accordance with Section 912.3.1. Stack vents and vent
stacks shall be permitted to terminate to stack-type air admittance valves in accordance with Section
912.3.2.

912.3.1 Horizontal branches. Individual and branch-type air admittance valves shall vent only fixtures that
are on the same floor level and connect to a horizontal branch drain. Where the horizontal branch is
located more than four branch intervals from the top of the stack, the horizontal branch shall be provided
with a relief vent that shall connect to a vent stack or stack vent, or extend outdoors to the open air. The
relief vent shall connect to the horizontal branch drain between the stack and the most downstream fixture
drain connected to the horizontal branch drain. The relief vent shall be sized in accordance with Section
904.1 and installed in accordance with Section 905. The relief vent shall be permitted to serve as the vent
for other fixtures.

912.3.2 Stack. Stack-type air admittance valves shall be prohibited from serving as the vent terminal for
vent stacks or stack vents that serve drainage stacks having more than six branch intervals.

912.4 Location. Individual and branch-type air admittance valves shall be located a minimum of 4 inches
(102 mm) above the horizontal branch drain or fixture drain being vented. Stack-type air admittance valves
shall be located not less than 6 inches (152 mm) above the flood level rim of the highest fixture being
vented. The air admittance valve shall be located within the maximum developed length permitted for the
vent. The air admittance valve shall be installed not less than 6 inches (152 mm) above insulation
materials.

912.5 Access and ventilation. Access shall be provided to all air admittance valves for the purpose of
maintenance or replacement. The valve shall be located within a ventilated space that allows air to enter
the valve.

912.6 Size. The air admittance valve shall be rated in accordance with the standard for the size of the vent
to which the valve is connected.

912.7 Vent required. Within each plumbing system, not less than one stack vent or vent stack shall extend
outdoors to the open air.

912.8 Prohibited installations. Air admittance valves shall not be installed in non-neutralized special
waste systems as described in Chapter 8 except where such valves are in compliance with ASSE 1049,
are constructed of materials approved in accordance with Section 811.2 and are tested for chemical
resistance in accordance with ASTM F 1412. Air admittance valves shall not be located in spaces utilized




as supply or return air plenums. Air admittance valves without an engineered design shall not be utilized to
vent sumps or tanks of any type.

Reasons: Air admittance valves are currently allowed in the 2012 International Plumbing Code Section
918.0 and were previously allowed in the Arizona State Plumbing Code, Arizona Administrative Code, Title
4, Chapter 48. This amendment is designed to align the acceptance of air admittance valves with the other
adopted plumbing code.

Cost Impact: Cost savings from reducing the number of plumbing vent pipes serving a building.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 11/20/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 11/21/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/16/14

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ 1 Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 2/18/14

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 2/26/14

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 1007.1

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

1007.0 Trap Seal Protection.

1007.1 General. Floor drain or similar traps directly connected to the drainage system and subject to
infrequent usage shall be protected with a trap seal primer, except where not deemed necessary for safety
of sanitation by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. Trap seal primers shall be accessible for maintenance.

Exception: Trap seal primer valves are not required when an alternative device is provided to prevent
evaporation of the liquid seal. Barrier type floor drain devices used to prevent evaporation shall conform to
ASSE 1072, be accessible for maintenance and installed in accordance with manufacturer’s instructions. A
source of water for filling of traps shall be located in the vicinity of the plumbing fixture.

Reasons:

A barrier-type device has been developed for installation in a floor drain that prevents evaporation of the
required liquid seal. This type of device opens when liquid enters the drain and then closes to prevent the
migration of sewer gases back into the building. The devices are installed in the body of the floor drain and
are typically made of an elastomeric material. Many of these devices are tested to several national
standards such as ASSE 1072 and are listed by both the ICC-ES (IPC) and IAPMO (UPC) major Code
agencies. The current Code requires that a trap seal primer valve be installed where trap seals are subject
to evaporation. Trap seal primer valves have been proven to be adversely affected by the hard water in
Phoenix and very often fail, thus leaving no trap seal protection. Once the liquid in the trap evaporates,
sewer gas will migrate into the building. This exception will allow use of the listed devices in place of the
trap seal primer valves required by the Code section.

Cost Impact: Cost savings from replacement of trap seal primer valves with lower cost barrier-type
devices and reduced maintenance.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/20/2012
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

BUILDING CONSTRUCTION CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendment to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Grease Interceptors, Section 1014.1.3

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1014.1.3 Food Waste Disposal Units and Dishwashers. Unless-specificallyrequired-orpermitted-by-the
Autheority Having-Jurisdiction,-ne All food waste dlsposal units oF and dishwashers shaII b&eenneeted—te@r

discharge into a grease interceptor.

directly-into-the-building’s-drainage-system- No commermal food waste d|sposal units and/or d|shwashers

shall discharge into a hydromechanical grease interceptor.

Reasons:

This code change is necessary to positively identify where disposals and dishwashers shall be discharged.
Connecting a commercial disposal unit and/or dishwasher to a hydromechanical interceptor will have a
negative effect on the operation, separation and grease retention efficiency of the device.

Cost Impact: No cost impact. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform
Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

BUILDING CONSTRUCTION CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendment to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Grease Interceptors, Section 1014.1

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1014.1 Where Required. Where it is determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction that waste
pretreatment is required, an approved type of grease interceptor(s) in accordance with the provisions of
this section shall be correctly sized and properly installed in grease waste line(s) leading from sinks and
drains, such as floor drains, floor sinks, and other fixtures or equipment in serving establishments such as
restaurants, cafes, lunch counters, cafeterias, bars and clubs, hotels, hospitals, sanitariums, factory or
school kitchens, or other establishments where grease is introduced into the drainage or sewage system
in quantities that can effect line stoppage or hinder sewage treatment or private sewage disposal. Where
approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction a combination of hydromechanical, gravity grease
interceptors, and engineered systems shall be allowed in order to meet this code and other applicable
requirements of-the-Autherity Having-Jurisdiction where space or existing physical constraints of existing
buildings necessitate such installations. A grease interceptor shall not be required for individual dwelling
units or for private living quarters. Water closets, urinals, and other plumbing fixtures conveying human
waste shall not drain into or through the grease interceptor.

Reasons:
Combination pretreatment systems are generally not allowed by the Environmental Services Division but
will be considered on a case by case basis.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Capacity, Section 1014.2.1

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1014.2.1 Capacity. The total capacity in gallons (gal) (L) of fixtures discharging into a hydromechanical
grease interceptor shall not exceed two and one-half times the certified gallon per minute (gpm) (L/s) flow
rate of the interceptor in accordance with Table 1014.2.1 and 1014.2.1A. No hydromechanical interceptor
shall be installed which has an approved rate of flow greater than fifty-five (55) gallons per minute or (3.5
L/s), nor less than twenty (20) gallons per minute (1.3 L/s) except where approved by the Authority Having
Jurisdiction.

For the purpose of this section, the term “fixture” shall mean and include each plumbing fixture, appliance,
apparatus, or other equipment required to be connected to or discharged into a grease interceptor by a
provision of this section.

Reasons:
The purpose of this code change is to provide the public with prescriptive sizing guidelines for
hydromechanical grease interceptors.

Cost Impact: No cost impact. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform
Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Interceptor Sizing, Table 1014.2.1A

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

Code Change Proposal. Add Table 1014.2.1A.

TABLE 1014.2.1A
HYDROMECHANICAL GREASE INTERCEPTOR SIZING BASED ON FIXTURE COUNT

Total Number of Grease | TOTAL FLOW-THROUGH RATING GREASE RETENTION
Retention Fixtures (gpm) CAPACITY (pounds)
Connected
1 20 40
2 25 50
3 35 70
4 50 100

For Sl Units: 1 gallon per minute = 0.06 L/s, 1 pound = 0.454 kg.

Reasons:
The purpose of adding this table to the code is to provide the public with prescriptive sizing guidelines for
hydromechanical grease interceptors.

Cost Impact: No cost impact. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform
Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Maintenance, Section 1014.2.3

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1014.2.3 Maintenance. A two way cleanout shall be installed on the discharge side of all
hydromechanical grease interceptors.

Reasons:
The purpose of this code section is to provide an entry point to clean the line downstream of the device
and back to the device.

Cost Impact: The cost impact is minimal to install additional piping for cleanouts. This requirement is an
amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Gravity Grease Interceptors, Section 1014.3.5

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1014.3.5 Construction Requirements. Gravity grease interceptors shall be designed to remove grease
from effluent and shall be sized in accordance with this section. Gravity grease interceptors shall also be
deS|gned to retain grease until accumulatlons can be removed by pumplng the mterceptor Itis

mterceptor capacﬂv shaII be 500 gallons and the maximum capacity shall be 5000 gallons unless

otherwise approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. A 500 gallon interceptor shall have a minimum of
two compartments and two man-ways. Interceptors 750 gallons and above shall have a minimum of three
compartments and three man-ways. All man-ways shall have a minimum 20" inside diameter. All
interceptors shall have a vented two-way cleanout on the discharge side of the interceptor. All interceptors
shall have a separate set of approved plans on file with the Environmental Services Division. The plans
shall be sealed by a registered professional engineer and be approved by the Authority Having
Jurisdiction. These plans shall be on file with the city before installation can be completed.

The grade rings (risers) and the inlet/outlet of gravity grease interceptors shall be grouted with shrink and
water proof grout. The interceptor lids shall be just above grade so as to prevent rain water infiltration. All
interceptors shall have gas tight and/or traffic rated lids where required.

Reasons: The Environmental Services Division does not sample effluent discharges from grease
interceptors therefore providing a sample box is an unnecessary expense for a facility. The additional
requirements establish construction parameters for interceptors.

Cost Impact: There is a cost savings for omitting sample boxes from all grease interceptor installations.
The additional requirements are amendments carried forward from the 2006 Uniform Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Gravity Grease Interceptors Sizing Example, 1014.3.6

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

EXAMPLE 1014.3.6
GRAVITY GREASE INTERCEPTOR SIZING EXAMPLE

Given: A restaurant with the following fixtures and equipment.

One food preparation sink; three floor drains — one in the food prep area, one in the grill area, and one
receiving the indirect waste from the ice machine and mop sink.

Kitchen Drain Line DFU Count (from Table 702.1):
3 floor drains at 2 DFUs each = 6 DFUs

Mop sink at 3 DFUs each = 3 DFUs
Food prep sink at 3 DFUs each = 3 DFUs
Total = 12 DFUs

)-1): Using UPC 1014.3.6:
12 DFUs X3 GPM X 12 mmute detent|on t|me 432 qallons The mterceptor will be sized at 500 gallons

(1893 L).

Reasons:
The purpose of this code change is to provide a design example that clearly illustrates how to size an
interceptor.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [[] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Gravity Grease Interceptors Sizing, Table 1014.3.6

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

Code Change Proposal: Delete Table 1014.3.6

Reasons:
The purpose of this code change is to delete a redundant section. Gravity grease interceptor sizing is
defined in UPC 1014.3.6.

Cost Impact: No cost impact. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform
Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Gravity Grease Interceptors Sizing Criteria, Section 1014.3.6

Submitted by: Environmental Services Division

1014.3.6 Sizing Criteria. The volume of the interceptor shall be determined by calculating drainage
fixture units (DFUs) using Table 10834-3.6 702.1. Where drainage fixture units (DFUs) are not known, the
interceptor shall be sized based on the maximum DFUs allowed for the pipe size connected to the inlet of
the interceptor. Refer to Table 703.2, Drainage Piping, Horizontal.

Example: Take the total DFUs going to grease waste, multiply by three (3) gallons per minute (GPM),
multiply by a 12 minute detention time and this will give the interceptor size in gallons. If there is a
disposal, use a 17 minute detention time.

Reasons:
The purpose of this code change is to define how an interceptor will be sized. The sizing criteria was
developed from three public forums held in 1997 to standardize gravity grease interceptor sizing.

Cost Impact: No cost impact. This requirement is an amendment carried forward from the 2006 Uniform
Plumbing Code.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [[] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 1017.1

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

1017.1 Interceptors Required. Repair garages and gasoline stations with grease racks or grease pits,
and factories that have oily, flammable, or both types of wastes as a result of manufacturing, storage,
maintenance, repair, or testing processes, and in hydraulic elevator pits shall be provided with an oil or
flammable liquid interceptor that shall be connected to necessary floor drains.

(Remainder of section to remain unchanged)

Exception: An oil interceptor is not required in hydraulic elevator pits where an approved alarm system is
installed.

Reasons:
Protect drainage system. Harmonize UPC with 2012 IPC section 1003.4 to be consistent in elevator
installations.

Cost Impact: Cost savings from installation of alarm system instead of oil interceptor.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [[] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 1101.11.1

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee
1101.11 Roof Drainage.

1101.11.1 Primary Roof Drainage. Roof areas of a building shall be drained by roof drains, scuppers or
gutters. The location and sizing of drains and gutters shall be coordinated with the structural design and
pitch of the roof. Scuppers shall be sized to prevent the depth of ponding water from exceeding that for
which the roof was designed as determined by this section. Scupper openings shall be not less than 4
inches (102 mm) in height and have an opening width equal to the circumference of the roof drain required
for the area served, sized in accordance with Table 1101.11. Unless otherwise required by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction, roof drains, scuppers, gutters, vertical conductors or leaders, and horizontal storm
drains for primary drainage shall be sized based on a rainfall rate of three (3) inches per hour sterm-of60

Reasons:

Current language in the 2012 UPC implies that scuppers are only approved for secondary roof drainage. It
has been a long standing practice in Phoenix to allow the use of scuppers as primary roof drains. This
proposal adds the acceptance of scuppers as primary roof drains and matches the sizing criteria found for
the secondary scuppers in section 1101.11.2.1. The annual rainfall rate is given in the Appendix D of this
code as 2.2 inches per hour. It is proposed to round this number up to 3 inches for ease of use of the
sizing tables.

** DAB Technical asked for further structural input on changing the rainfall rate to 3 inches per hour.

Cost Impact: Cost savings from allowing scuppers for primary roof drainage and from reducing the design
rainfall rate from the current six (6) inches per hour (2006 UPC) down to three (3) inches per hour.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
[ 1 Approved as submitted  [X] Modified and approved  [] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 02/12/2013
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 2/21/13
X Approved as submitted  [] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 1101.11.2

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

1101.11.2 Secondary drainage. Secondary (emergency) roof drainage shall be provided by one of the
methods specified in Section 1101.11.2.1 or 1101.11.2.2.

1101.11.2.1 Roof Scuppers or Open Side. Secondary roof drainage shall be provided by an open-sided
roof or scuppers where the roof perimeter construction extends above the roof in such a manner that water
will be entrapped. An open-sided roof or scuppers shall be sized to prevent the depth of ponding water
from exceeding that for which the roof was designed as determined by Section 1101.11.1. Scupper
openings shall be a minimum of 4' inches (102 mm) high and have a width equal to the circumference of
the roof drain required for the area served, sized in accordance with Table 1101.11.

1101.11.2.2 Secondary Roof Drain. Secondary roof drains shall be provided. The secondary roof drains
shall be located a minimum of 2 inches (51 mm) above the roof surface. The maximum height of the roof
drains shall be a height to prevent the depth of ponding water from exceeding that for which the roof was
designed as determined by Section 1101.11.1. The secondary roof drains shall connect to a piping system

conforming to Section 1101.11.2.2(A)-e~1101-11-2.2(B).

1101.11.2.2(A) Separate Piping System. The secondary roof drainage system shall be a separate
system of piping, independent of the primary roof drainage system. The discharge shall be above grade, in
a location observable by the building occupants or maintenance personnel. Secondary roof drain systems
shall be sized in accordance with Section 1101.11.1 based on the rainfall rate for which the primary
system is sized.

Reasons:
The city of Phoenix does not allow for combined primary and secondary rainwater removal systems. A
combined system does not have any way to indicate there is a blockage in the primary drain.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Section 1104.3

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

Reasons:
The city of Phoenix does not allow for combined sanitary and storm drainage systems. This type of
combined system is under the jurisdiction of the city of Phoenix Water Services Department.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendment to 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Chapter 12

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

CHAPTER 12
FUEL GAS PIPING
Reserved

Delete entire content of Chapter 12.

Reasons:

All the code sections are represented in the 2012 International Fuel Gas Code. Duplication of the material
may be confusing. While both the IFGC and the UPC use NFPA 54 as the basis of their code language,
the different code bodies diverge in specific areas. This could lead to conflicts.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 12/13/2012
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13

X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved ~ [] Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken




¢

City of Phoenix

PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT DEPARTMENT

CODE CHANGE PROPOSAL

Proposed Amendments to the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code
Appendices

Submitted by: Phoenix Planning and Development Department Code Committee

Adopt Appendices: A, B, B, |

Reasons:

Appendix A provides an alternative engineered method of water pipe sizing. Appendix B provides
additional information on combination waste and vent systems. Appendix D provides tables of maximum
rates of rainfall for cities in the US and is used to size rainwater roof drains, leaders and scuppers.
Previous amended section 1101.11.1.1 establishes the rainfall rate as 3 inches per hour so Appendix D is
not needed. Appendix | contains installation standards for various piping systems.

Cost Impact: No cost impact.

ACTION TAKEN:

2012 Code Committee Date: 01/03/2013
X Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied [ ] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Technical Subcommittee Date: 1/17/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ ] Denied  [] No action taken
Development Advisory Board Date: 1/17/13
X1 Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
Council Subcommittee Date: 4/16/13
X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken
City Council Action Date: 5/15/13

X] Approved as submitted [ ] Modified and approved [ Denied  [] No action taken




	IPC 00 Chapter 1, Part 2
	IPC 0202
	IPC 0403.1 Table
	IPC 0403.2
	IPC 0410.3
	IPC 0419.2
	IPC 0605.3
	IPC 0605.5
	IPC 0608.3.2
	IPC 0608.7.1
	IPC 0608.7.2
	IPC 0704.1
	IPC 0803.2
	IPC 1002.4
	IPC 1003.2
	IPC 1003.3.1
	IPC 1003.3.2
	IPC 1003.3.4.1
	IPC 1003.3.4.3
	IPC 1106.1
	IPC 1106.5
	IPC 1108.3
	IPC 1109.1
	IPC Appendices E,F
	UPC 0209.0a
	UPC 0209.0b
	UPC 0210.0
	UPC 0415.2
	UPC 0422.1 Table
	UPC 0422.2
	UPC 0603.4.03
	UPC 0603.4.09
	UPC 0603.4.10
	UPC 0718.1
	UPC 1007.1
	UPC 1014.1.3
	UPC 1014.1
	UPC 1014.2.1
	UPC 1014.2.1A Table
	UPC 1014.2.3
	UPC 1014.3.5
	UPC 1014.3.6 example
	UPC 1014.3.6 Table
	UPC 1014.3.6
	UPC 1017.1
	UPC 1101.11.1
	UPC 1101.11.2.2
	UPC 1104.3
	UPC Chapter 12
	UPC appendices

