
AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

EH8 19059785 1611 W VINEYARD RD Rudy / Tracy (<=$25K) Rehab Resdl (C61)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Unsuccessful bid$18,345.00

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Unsuccessful bid$15,890.00

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$15,900.00

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Unsuccessful bid$16,150.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$16,038.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Apparent low bidder$13,555.00

SWABS-AZ, INC. Response "no bid" (busy)



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

EH8 19059789 12031 N 23RD ST Rudy / Rose (<=$25K) Rehab Resdl (C61)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Unsuccessful bid$22,850.00

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Unsuccessful bid$23,850.00

SWABS-AZ, INC. Response "no bid" (busy)

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$25,800.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$22,276.00

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Apparent low bidder$19,833.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Unsuccessful bid$25,200.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

WA8 19060963 4723 N 23RD DR David / TracyWeatherization

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Apparent low bidder$9,608.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Unsuccessful bid$10,350.00



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

EH8 19060981 8031 N 11TH PL Rudy / Tracy (<=$25K) Rehab Resdl (C61)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC Unsuccessful bid$14,095.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$19,928.00

RECON RESTORATION Response "no bid" (busy)

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Unsuccessful bid$14,182.00

SWABS-AZ, INC. Response "no bid" (busy)

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Unsuccessful bid$15,600.00

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Apparent low bidder$11,564.00



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

WA8 19060983 5233 W LEWIS AVE David / RoseWeatherization

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Unsuccessful bid$15,100.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC No response

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Apparent low bidder$13,852.00



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

WA8 19060999 18 W GRISWOLD RD David / RoseWeatherization

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Apparent low bidder$7,506.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Unsuccessful bid$8,725.00



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

WA8 19061060 6810 N 35TH AVE David / RoseWeatherization

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Unsuccessful bid$6,550.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Apparent low bidder$3,537.00



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

EH8 19061072 5432 S 13TH PL David / Tracy (No Limit) Rehab Resdl (B-3)

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$37,000.00

BOYJIN DEVELOPMENT Unsuccessful bid$32,839.00

ZOMARK CONSTRUCTION, LLC No response

G & G SPECIALTY CONTRACTORS, INC No response

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Apparent low bidder$32,650.00

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Unsuccessful bid$34,350.00

SWABS-AZ, INC. Response "no bid" (busy)



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

EH8 19061580 1221 N 34TH ST Eddie / TracyPlumbing - Residential

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

ANDY'S PLUMBING Apparent low bidder$8,600.00

ADOBE ENERGY MANAGEMENT Unsuccessful bid$9,275.00



AddressCase # Trade R. S. / L.P.Program

Bids Results
From 10/29/2019 To 10/29/2019

LC3 19061925 368 N 20TH DR Eddie / BrendaLead Based Paint Abatement

Contractor Bid ResultBase Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3

RECON RESTORATION Unsuccessful bid$16,500.00

D & K ENTERPRISES, LLC Apparent low bidder$12,950.00

STRATTON RESTORATION LLC Unsuccessful bid$18,115.00

VIZCOM CONTRACTING, LLC Rejected (error or incomplete)


